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SECUF and All In Credit Union Award More Than  
$40,000 to Support Small Credit Unions  

 
TALLAHASSEE, FL – The Southeastern Credit Union Foundation (SECUF), the charitable arm of the 
League of Southeastern Credit Unions (LSCU), and All In Credit Union in Daleville, Alabama are 
excited to announce that more than $40,000 has been awarded to small credit unions in our three-
state footprint with assets of 100 million dollars or less. The All In Fund is an additional resource 
created to aid small credit unions in Alabama, South Georgia, and Florida obtaining or retaining 
benefits provided by LSCU membership, including but not limited to, Small Credit Union Initiative 
funds, facilitation of strategic planning sessions, and guidance to enhance member utilization of credit 
union products and services. 
 
“At All In Credit Union, we are committed to strengthening and supporting small asset-sized credit 
unions and advancing them in the credit union mission,” said Bobby Michael, President and CEO of All 
In Credit Union. “This fund is just one way we can help alleviate any financial burden for these small 
credit unions. We fully believe in this partnership with SECUF and are excited to make an impact with 
small credit unions as they continue to provide a valuable resource for their communities.” 
 
The Small Asset Size Fund that SECUF has had for many years will include these All In Credit Union 
Fund resources to provide financial relief to small credit unions by supporting their LSCU membership 
for the 2023 year, freeing them from financial obligations and enabling them to concentrate on 
providing exceptional service to their members.  
 
“This partnership with All In Credit Union gives credit unions the opportunity to take advantage of 
LSCU resources offered to our members through legislative and grassroots advocacy, regulatory and 
compliance support, and education and professional development,” said Samantha Beeler, President 
of LSCU. “We are so appreciative of Bobby and the All In Credit Union Board for their generosity and 
spirit of cooperatives supporting other cooperatives.” 
 
For any questions, contact Bobbi Grady, Foundation Director, at Bobbi.Grady@lscu.coop.  
 
 
ABOUT ALL IN CREDIT UNION 
 
All In Credit Union is a full-service financial institution with $2.7 billion in assets. They have 30 branches 
in Alabama, Florida and Mississippi and provide personalized financial solutions to more than 158,000 
members worldwide. The organization and its employees are committed to enriching the lives of others 
by helping them reach their goals and achieve financial success. For more information, visit 
www.allincu.com. 
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ABOUT THE SOUTHEASTERN CREDIT UNION FOUNDATION  
 
The Southeastern Credit Union Foundation is a nonprofit organization dedicated to the progressive 
professional development of credit union staff and volunteers, financial capability programs for all age 
groups, and the creation of valuable resources for our member credit unions and the communities they 
serve. The SECUF mission is to support economic growth by promoting financial wellness, sparking 
collaborative community initiatives, and providing disaster preparedness and relief to credit unions. 
 
ABOUT THE LEAGUE OF SOUTHEASTERN CREDIT UNIONS & AFFILIATES 
 
The League of Southeastern Credit Unions & Affiliates represents 302 credit unions throughout Alabama, 
Florida, and Georgia and has a combined total of more than $175 billion in assets and more than 11.6 
million members. LSCU provides advocacy, compliance services, education and training, cooperative 
initiatives, and communications. For more information, visit www.lscu.coop. Follow LSCU on LinkedIn, 
Twitter, and Facebook.  
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